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 Students native to the Arabian Gulf region often struggle with reading skills. The 
purpose of this study was to explore the reading habits and reading culture of 
Emirati undergraduate students and to investigate the use of a particular reading 
strategy (Listening While Reading) on undergraduate Emirati students reading rate 
and comprehension. This case study was conducted through a mixed method 
research design.  It was carried out with sixty-one SLL (second language learners) 
undergraduate students. By assigning them into two groups, the experimental 
group (28 students) was given books with an auditory component, while the 
control group (33 students) was given the same books but without the auditory 
component.  both positive and negative reflections from teachers and students on 
different aspects of the LWR experiences are discussed. Qualitative findings 
revealed more contextualized results related to the lack of comprehension 
improvement such as, lack of reading habits. Additionally, quantitative results 
indicated that the performance of students in reading rate and accuracy improved 
over time. However, reading comprehension did not improve. Additionally, 
implications in terms of the use of the LWR in English language classes for 
practitioners are discussed as well as recommendations for future studies. 

Keywords: reading fluency, accuracy, automaticity, reading rate, second language 
learning, United Arab Emirates context, reading comprehension, listening while reading 

INTRODUCTION 

All students who enter national public universities in the United Arab Emirates (UAE) 
must take an English language exam. Students who obtain below a certain score are 
required to take pre-sessional foundation English classes. Test results indicate that 
students struggle the most with reading.  Yet, at the time of this study, little was known 
about the students’ individual reading levels or how to implement a reading program 
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whereby the students are placed at a reading level based on these individual needs. 
Instead, courses were developed using an integrated skills model.  They could pass the 
class, even though they had weak reading skills, and moved on to the next course. 
Reading difficulties with this population have been well documented in Al Murshidi 
(2014) and O’Sullivan (2004). For teachers to best determine how to support students in 
reading, data needs to be collected on why students struggle with this skill and on which 
strategies best substantiate student learning. 

The fundamental purpose of reading can be defined as assigning and/or deriving 
meaning from text. Reading then can be defined as the process of deconstructing a 
written text while, simultaneously, assigning meaning to it (Grabe & Stoller, 2013; 
Hudson, 2007). At the tertiary level, skilled reading comprehension is a complex 
cognitive process that involves many higher-level cognitive skills such as making 
predictions and inferences, extracting and synthesizing information, recognizing 
author’s stance, and distinguishing between opinion and fact. In addition to these skills, 
readers at the college level also need to be able to utilize contextual and structural clues 
to form a logical understanding of the communicative purpose of a text. Although the 
central issue in this paper is reading comprehension, the focus is also on a specific 
reading component that is central to reading comprehension namely reading fluency. 

The rationale of this focus is that a large body of research has shown that the higher-
level processes that influence and determine effective comprehension do not become 
fully operational until the reader has acquired a reasonable level of fluency (Adams, 
1990; Gough & Tunmer, 1986; Hoover & Gough, 1990; Kuhn & Stahl, 2003; Perfetti, 
1985; Sticht & James, 1996; Vellutino, Scanlon, & Tanzman, 1994). In other words, for 
college students to read a text and achieve adequate comprehension, they should be able 
to read the text in question effortlessly. One of the goals of this study is to examine 
whether reading fluency can be improved by using a Listening While Reading (LWR) 
intervention to support reading improvement at Zayed University’s, a United Arab 
Emirates (UAE) national university, EAP classrooms. 

Significance of the Study 

Little is known about the capability of university students in the UAE when it comes to 
reading fluency and the strategies employed when reading a text. Hence, it is important 
first to look at the quality of reading in the UAE where increasing English language 
proficiency and reading quality is a top priority of educational reform (O’Sullivan, 
2016). A primary issue with understanding the educational needs of this specific 
population is a lack of quality research available; therefore, educational specialists often 
rely on studies conducted in Western countries.   This is turn makes it difficult for 
teachers to determine the reading needs for their individual students.  This study hopes 
to shed some light on the subject. 

Studies of assisted reading have demonstrated the effectiveness of Listening while 
Reading (LWR) in promoting reading processes. This study aims to explore the use of 
LWR in this context. More specifically, this case study aims to investigate the 
effectiveness of LWR in promoting improvements in Emirati SLL students’ reading 
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fluency, with a focus on reading rate and accuracy. This is beneficial for this context 
specifically as this population was detected with significant deficit in their English 
language reading skills and lack of motivation towards reading in general (Al-Nafisah, 
2011; Gobert, 2009; Mourtaga, 2006; O’Sullivan, 2009). 

The goal of this paper was also to investigate reading fluency, reading culture and 
reading habits among university students in the United Arab Emirates enrolled in 
foundational English courses by addressing these questions: 

1.   What are students’ perceptions of LWR intervention towards reading 
comprehension? 
2.    To which extent could students’ reading habits be explained by their reading 
culture and exposure in the UAE context? 
3.  Does LWR effect reading rate, accuracy, and/or comprehension with population? 

LITERATURE REVIEW 

Reading Fluency and Reading Comprehension 

Fluent reading has been recognized as a central component of skilled reading. It refers 
to the ability to read easily and accurately (Burt, Peyton, & Van Duzer, 2005). It is also 
considered by organizations such as the National Reading Panel, the National Institute 
for Literacy, and the National Center for the Study of Adult Learning and Literacy 
(NCSALL) as a major component for optimum reading development (Kuhn, 
Schwanenflugel, & Meisinger, 2010). While reading fluency has been well investigated 
in the K-12 environment, little research has been conducted at the university level.  
Taguchi (1997) found that reading rates increased for Japanese university students but 
fluency was not transferred when asked to read silently on a new test.   

Reading fluency involves several components.  One characteristic of a fluent reader 
includes the reading of text at a conversational level which can be replicated at different 
times and with various texts   Another characteristic is the reading of text in a flowing 
manner without interruption (Hudson, Lane & Pullen, 2005).   Therefore, reading 
fluency is determined through the measurement of rate and accuracy through oral 
reading.  Research suggests that oral reading fluency has a strong concurrent 
relationship to reading comprehension (Fuchs et al., 2001; Hudson et al., 2008; Kuhn et 
al., 2010; Kuhn & Stahl, 2003). In recent years, instructional methodologies have been 
developed that are aimed at improving reading fluency. Of interest to this paper is the 
investigation of the effect of assisted reading, specifically listening while reading 
(LWR).      

Listening While Reading (LWR) 

Reading fluency can be fostered through a process called assisted reading or listening 
while reading (LWR) (Rasinski & Hoffman, 2003). LWR involves having the student 
read silently while simultaneously listening to a fluent rendition of the reading passage. 
LWR helps develop reading fluency through a neurological impress model. While 
reading along, a more fluent reader creates alternative neural pathways through a strong 
multisensory reinforcement technique (Kuhn & Stahl, 2003). The auditory version of the 
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reading can be performed by a fluent adult reader or by the use of various technological 
devices. 

LWR proved to enhance young and adult students reading fluency. LWR reported 
positive results on reading fluency for elementary readers even when variations of LWR 
as an instructional method were used (Carbo, 1978; Chomsky, 1976; Heckelman, 1969). 
It enhanced comprehension rates for second grade students when implemented on both 
easy and more difficult passages (Blonder et al., 2018). Additionally, when compared 
with repeated reading for third graders, listening to the text being read by the instructor 
while they read along (LWR) proved to develop reading fluency and general proficiency 
in reading (Rasinski, 2006). Furthermore, Reissner (1997) described LWR as a ‘time 
efficient method to bring those at-risk to a comparable level to those who have been 
exposed to a print rich environment’ (p. 298). Along with oral reading improvement, 
Reissner (1997) also found that this method improved attitudes, motivation, and self-
confidence. Moreover, when LWR was employed for Spanish-speaking students who 
were learning English as a second language (ESL), it improved reading rates, decreased 
error rates, and resulted in improved comprehension skills (VanWagenen, Williams, & 
McLaughlin, 1994). Additionally, when implementing this technique for one year with 
230 Japanese undergraduate students, it was shown that their reading rate and 
vocabulary recognition as measured by the Test of English as a Foreign Language 
(TOEFL) significantly improved.  However, no effect was seen on their general English 
proficiency (Gobel & Kano, 2014). Hence, it is argued whether the gain in reading 
comprehension is the result of the amount of reading practice or the result of learning a 
new skill, connecting and linking text to oral language (Kuhn & Stahl, 2003). In other 
words, it is not certain if LWR is a successful method alone or if it is affected by 
external factors.   

Running Records 

Keeping running records has been well documented as a tool to inform teaching 
practice.  Lipp and Helfrich (2016) argue that running records have the ability to inform 
teachers about individual students’ strengths and weaknesses in fluency.  The authors 
claim that they only need about one hundred words to understand their students’ 
struggles.  Fountas, Pinnell, and Le Verrrier (2001) claimed that running records should 
assess oral rate, oral accuracy and comprehension (orally or through written questions).  
Using this method, teachers note issues that students may have with reading and use this 
information to inform best classroom practices.  Many of these assessments are used as 
informal assessments.  Frequent monitoring help teachers determine the correct reading 
level for their students; therefore, ensuring that the available reading for that student is 
not too difficult or too easy.   

Reading in the Arab World 

While literacy levels in the Arab World have increased in the last twenty years, 
Mourtaga (2006) argued that some of the Arab populations have limited literacy skills at 
least in part due to a lack of reading habits even at home (Gobert, 2009; Khreisat & 
Kaur, 2014; O’Sullivan 2009)).  A significant deficit in English language reading skills 
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may lead to difficulties with reading at the university level (O’Sullivan, 2009; 
O’Sullivan, 2016). O’Sullivan (2009) adds that the ‘negative prior learning experiences 
at school’ is an additional problem with reading. This is rooted to the outdated school-
based language teaching methodologies used by teachers who teach to the exams, rather 
than, focusing on strategies that would ultimately develop students’ reading skills. 
Limited use of libraries by both teachers and students and lack of resources necessary 
are further inhibitors (O’Sullivan, 2009). 

An absence of motivation and interest are attributed to weak reading habits in the Arab 
world (Al-Nafisah, 2011). Having poor reading habits and limited exposure to print are 
identified as indicators of poor reading comprehension (Stanovich, 2009). Indeed, 
exposure to print augments the lexical semantic knowledge and a large vocabulary 
correlates positively with reading acquisition. Thus, being frequently exposed to print, is 
especially advantageous in widening the semantic lexicon, which in turn facilitates and 
enhances reading acquisition (Stanovich, 2009). As such, students need to know 98%-
99% of the words before adequate comprehension is possible (Hirsh & Nation, 1992). 

In the UAE, reading habits are associated with certain factors. For instance, Emirati 
female students conveyed their strong interest and self-motivation when reading the 
Quran (Kamhieh, 2012). Others expressed their willingness to read based on the 
teacher’s request or the main character of the story, the length of the textbook, or on the 
literary quality and cost (Khreisat & Kaur, 2014). Despite this fact, these students 
recognized the importance of reading for improving their language and academic 
achievement, as they are aware of the necessity for assisted reading techniques for the 
development of their reading fluency and comprehension (Khreisat & Kaur, 2014). For 
instance, college students in the UAE expressed their preferences for LWR (Gobert, 
2009). While their preferences were investigated, there was no empirical research to 
date that supported the effect of assisted reading techniques such as LWR on college 
students’ reading fluency and comprehension in the UAE. 

METHOD 

Context 

The United Arab Emirates (UAE) strives to provide students with a first-rate 
educational system and a progressive national curriculum by ensuring high literacy rates, 
integrating modern education programs, and providing equal opportunities for all 
students (Ministry of Education, 2017). Therefore, educational reform was influenced 
mainly by technological innovations, enhancement of the curriculum, and best teaching 
strategies to provide learners with a postive learning environment (Abu-Samaha & 
Shishakly, 2008). The country has a wide range of universities in both the public and 
private sectors where publicly funded higher education is offered mainly to nationals. 

This study was conducted in one of these publicly funded universities in the UAE, 
Zayed University.  It has two modern campuses in Abu Dhabi and Dubai that welcomes 
both national and international students. However, most of the undergraduate students 
are Emirati whose first language is Arabic. Most of these students come from 
government schools that follow the standard national curriculum. In these schools, 
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Arabic is the main language of instruction for all subjects while English is taught and is 
used as a second language for teaching technical or scientific subjects only.  Despite this 
fact, higher education institutions in the UAE provide all their courses in English except 
for Islamic and Arabic courses. Therefore, to support students’ deficit in English and 
strengthen their reading skills, the university provides a language support program 
called the Academic Bridge Program (ABP) for up to one year before entering content-
rich classes. Students are enrolled in the ABP to study and practice writing, reading, 
listening and speaking in English. The program consists of three levels.  Students in 
ENG 020 scored the lowest on the entrance exam.  Students in ENG 030 passed ENG 
020 or scored well enough on the entrance exam to be placed in this level.  Students in 
ENG 040 passed ENG 030 or scored well enough on the entrance exam to be placed in 
this level and is therefore the highest level. The entrance exam is the Common 
Educational Proficiency Assessment (CEPA) which is administered nationwide by the 
Ministry of Education of the UAE and is regarded as both reliable and valid (Coombe & 
Davidson, 2014). The scores determines whether the student is eligible to enter an 
academic program directly without the need of a foundation program in English 
(www.adm.moe.gov.ae). 

Design 

This population, as previously mentioned, struggles with reading as indicated in multiple 
tests and through research. Therefore, several teachers decided to conduct research to 
determine if a common strategy used in the K-12 and L1 environment would work in 
this setting. This case study used a mixed method design.  The purpose of the study was 
to explore the possibility of implementing LWR in this context and to both better 
understand and document student reading habits and experiences.  In alignment with 
previous studies that researched the impact of reading on second language learning 
through pre-and post-test comparison designs (Elley & Mangubhai, 1983; Nakanishi, 
2015) and due to the uniqueness of the context of this study regarding the deficiency of 
reading habits in general and specifically in English as a second language, this 
exploratory study will follow a mixed method design to investigate and increase 
awareness about the topic through both qualitative and quantitative research (Creswell, 
2009).  Both groups tested at the same reading levels and were asked to read books at 
this level.  The LWR option was provided only to the experimental group. A pre-test 
and post-test were completed by the two groups at the beginning and at the end of the 
study. After conducting the experiment, qualitative data was collected. Interviews with 
teachers and focus groups with the experimental group only were conducted in order to 
collect in-depth views and perceptions of students’ experiences when listening while 
reading (Seidman, 2013). 

Participants 

Sixty-one undergraduate Emirati students and two teachers from Zayed University in the 
UAE participated in the study. Teachers are both qualified and have more than 7 years 
of experience in teaching SLLs in the UAE. All the students were enrolled in the 
Academic Bridge Program (ABP). The ABP is an English Language foundation 
program that supports undergraduates who have not met the requirements of EMSAT 

http://www.adm.moe.gov.ae/
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English Score of 1250 or an academic IELTS score of 5.5 or a TOEFL iBT 71+ score. 
These students are enrolled in the ABP for a period of up to 4 semesters before being 
eligible to join the majors. Upon completion of the ABP, students must have an IELTS 
exit score of 5.5 or above (www.zu.ac.ae). 

17% of the students’ participants were male while 83% were female. The students who 
participated in this study were all enrolled in four different introductory level (ENG 
020) classes. The inclusionary criteria to participate in the study were that the student is 
between 18 and 22, is enrolled full time in one of the different classes and has never had 
a history of language disorders or delays, social, emotional, or psychiatric problems (via 
teacher and personal report). The classes were assigned to one of two groups: 
experimental group 1 (n= 28), and control group 2 (n=33).  The participants in the two 
groups had a CEPA score between 150 and 171. The mean scores were respectively: 
156.25 (range 150 to 171) (SD= 6.08), 155 (range= 152 to 169) (SD= 3.76). Based on 
these results, the students in this study were shown to be at risk and therefore, may 
struggle with an English-medium university curriculum. They were placed in the lowest 
English level as a result. The attrition rate was high for this level. Before the EMSAT, 
the university used the Common Educational Proficiency Assessment (CEPA) to 
determine placement in the Academic Bridge Program. The CEPA exam is an 
assessment developed in the UAE and was given to all students exiting high school. 
After entering the university, all students in the ABP are once again tested with a writing 
exam to make sure that they have been placed in the correct level.  

Materials 

Participants were given access to an online professional reading program called Reading 
A-Z using an iPad App. Reading A-Z is designed to be used with native English 
speakers as well as second language learners (https://www.readinga-z.com). There were 
several reasons for choosing this particular program: a) it was available on campus b) it 
is based on best practices and is developed with SLLs in mind c) it has a rich collection 
of levelled books; d) it includes tests that allow to establish a baseline and monitor 
students’ progress; e) students are able to listen and read simultaneously. Even though 
the books in this program were geared towards young learners, the fact that they 
provided clear and interesting illustrations along with the reading text, and that their 
length allowed them to be read in one class period made them an adequate choice for the 
intervention. Using children’s literature to further adult literacy is a method that has 
been used in the SLL classroom and that has yielded positive results (Chen, 2012; 
Garcia, 2007; Smallwood, 1998). 

Assessing reading fluency was conducted through the administration of the two types of 
assessments that are included in the A-Z Reading App. The first type of fluency 
assessment is a one-minute timed reading of a passage to measure the number (reading 
rate) and accuracy of words read. In this study, reading rated was used as a measure of 
automaticity. According to Paris & Carpenter (2003) commercial reading inventories are 
generally reliable and valid. DeGennaro (2018) found that Reading A-Z analyzes text 
using both qualitative and quantitative measures to include the following: 

http://www.zu.ac.ae/
about:blank
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Table 1 
Text Analysis 

Qualitative ● predictability of text 
● text structure and organization 
● illustration support 
● infographics 

Quantitative ● total word count 
● number of different words 
● ratio of different words to total words 
● number of high frequency words, ratio of high frequency words to total words 
● number of low frequency words, 
● ratio of low frequency words to total words 
● sentence length 
● sentence complexity (p. 28) 

The testing was administered by the researcher who visited each class and tested the 
students individually. A running record was administered as recommended at each of the 
testing periods, the students were given a one-minute reading. The researcher started the 
stopwatch when the student began the first word of the passage (student did not read 
titles). The researcher told the student that if she or he has trouble (struggling for more 
than 3 to 5 seconds), that they will say the word so she or he can keep reading. After one 
minute, the researchers said ‘Stop,’ stopped the stopwatch, and circled the last word 
read.  Students then answered comprehension questions to measure comprehension 
through a professionally developed question set.    

Procedures 

At the onset of the study, a pre-test was administered to obtain a baseline reading rate, 
accuracy score and comprehension score. Students were then given books at the same 
reading level and were allotted a minimum twenty minutes a day for reading in class for 
the period of 8 weeks as this was the maximum amount of time allowed in this setting. 
Participants in the experimental group (group 1) were given books and were asked to 
listen while reading while participants in the control group were given the same books 
but were asked to read without listening (group 2). 

A running record was kept for each participant as recommended by Hudson, Lane and 
Pullen (2005) who argue that contextualized reading, oral reading and timed reading can 
accurately access students reading rate and accuracy.  The researchers collected scores 
from each subject in tasks of rate, accuracy and comprehension. Each subject was tested 
two times. Thus, each subject had two scores: a score collected before the treatment 
(pre-test), and a score collected after the end of intervention (post-test). 

Due to the originality of this study within the UAE context, qualitative data was highly 
needed to elaborate on the quantitative findings to further understand them the reading 
culture in the UAE. Therefore, at the end of the study, 4 focus groups with 7 students 
each (28 students in total) and two interviews with two faculty members were conducted 
to explore their perceptions of LWR. Questions were divided into three main themes 
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namely, reading habits, use of technology while reading, (see Appendix 1).   A total of 
10 semi-structured questions were asked.  

Interviews with teachers were conducted to collect their perceptions of the impact that 
the LWR had on students’ accuracy and comprehension. Teachers were asked a total of 
five semi-structured questions (see Appendix 1).  As this was an exploratory study 
questions were developed to determine general perceptions as experienced by the 
teachers.  However, follow-up questions could include more specific questions based on 
the teachers’ individual experiences and as topics emerged. 

Interviews were analyzed using Rubin and Rubin’s (2011) interviewing procedure that 
employs in-depth interviewing techniques. As such, the interpretive analysis was done 
with the extensive focus on the three main themes. After obtaining participants’ consent 
and assuring anonymity, the interviewer took hand notes of the responses. The 
interviewer also kept a reflective journal to support the data analysis process by 
including the researchers’ feelings, ideas, and impressions (Creswell, 2009). 

Data Analysis 

Focus group and interviews were manually transcribed. NVivo was used to analyze the 
transcribed data and extract categories and themes based on Spradley’s (1979) 
taxonomic analysis, starting with broad question and then narrowing them to gather 
more specific information when needed. This analysis technique helped the data to be 
coded into themes and then categories. Two researchers independently analyzed the data 
to ensure reliability. Data was coded based on themes. Quotes as evidences were 
assigned for each theme.  The Statistical Package for the Social Sciences (SPSS) version 
23 was used to analyze the quantitative portion of the data and compare mean 
differences on the pre and post-test using a t-test. 

FINDINGS  

This section is divided into two parts:  the qualitative outcomes and the quantitative 
results.  The qualitative portion underscored several important views that the students 
had toward reading. Two main themes emerged based on the analysis of the responses 
given during focus groups with students and during interviews with faculty members 
including perceptions of listening while reading and reading culture. 

Perceptions toward LWR on Reading Fluency and Comprehension 

Analysis of the data highlighted the views that the students and the teachers had toward 
LWR. Students claimed that reading and listening to the same story simultaneously was 
beneficial for several reasons such as an improved acquisition of new vocabulary. Fifty-
three percent of students commented on improvements made in vocabulary acquisition.  
Examples of these comments include: 

Researcher: “Can you explain any positives that you have noticed?”  
Student A:  “increased my vocabulary”  
Student J: “some words we can’t read but when we listen, we understand 
better” 
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Twenty-five percent of students indicated that they understood the content better 
because of LWR, for example:  

Student B:  “I understand more”  
Student C:  “some of the questions are difficult but with the listening they were 
ok”  

Seventeen percent of students indicated that LWR assisted with pronunciation, while 
eight percent indicate that it helped with spelling: 

Student I:  “we learn how to spell the word” 
Student K: “with the listening you know how to pronounce the words which 
help” 

When asked “Can you explain any negatives that you have noticed?”, twenty-one 
percent of students argued that the texts were difficult.  Some examples of these 
responses are as follows: 

 Student A: “.... they were sometimes difficult” 

Another student stated that while the reading was easy, the vocabulary was sometimes 
difficult 

Student B: “it (the reading) is easy, but there are some words that we cannot say, 
and we cannot understand it”  

Still other students found the questions difficult: 

Student C: “and I don’t understand the new words and it is difficult” 

The teachers argued that the experience was beneficial for students. While they were not 
able to determine with certainty if students’ reading improved, they felt that students 
enjoyed the experience and were usually ready to read, without hesitation, during the 
portion of the class allocated to LWR on the iPad. One teacher highlighted this by 
saying: 

Teacher A:  “I know they enjoyed reading.  I could see that.  I can’t really say 
that they are reading better.  Once I said let’s do it, they didn’t complain until 
maybe the last week and that could be for many reasons because they had many 
exams that week” 

Another teacher concurred by claiming:  

Teacher B:  “Some of them wanted to read in their free time at home. They liked 
the variety of topics of the books.  Another teacher highlighted that they thought 
the ubiquitous aspect of reading on the iPad was beneficial: ‘I can read 
anywhere”   

Reading culture 

In order to form an accurate understanding of the topic within the context of the learner, 
students were asked during the focus groups to describe their experiences with reading 
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as children as well as their habits since then.  Twenty-five percent of the students 
indicated that a family member read to them during childhood. However, the majority 
indicated that they were not read to as a child. Still, some stated that while they were not 
read to as children, they were told oral stories, without text, about their country’s past 
and local folklore. One student inferred to a possible generational gap between younger 
parents and older grandparents when she stated that: 

Student O: “my grandmother told me the story, but my mom and dad read me the 
story” 

In general, these reading habits, or lack thereof, remained consistent until the students 
attended university. While seventy-one percent of the students had read some for school, 
in either Arabic or English, they did not read a lot of books before coming to the 
university. One student elaborated on this point:  

Student N:  “yes, not much because I don’t like to read, I never read”  

In general, this was the consensus.  Although, all students preferred to read in Arabic 
instead of English only a few read in Arabic frequently. Thirty-nine percent indicated 
that when they read it was in Arabic.  They found the following types of text the most 
interesting: poems (11%), Islamic stories (3%), stories (79%) and the news (46%). Even 
though the students were interested in these text types, they still were not interested in 
forming reading habits with longer texts that were time-consuming. 

While most students were not readers in the traditional sense, sixty-eight percent often 
read through social media and/or through social networking Apps. Two of their 
favourite Apps/sites were Twitter and Blackberry Messenger. When they were asked 
why they preferred to read using these tools, they stated that the text ‘was short’ and that 
‘the vocabulary was not difficult’.  They read in both English and Arabic when reading 
on social media sites. 

LWR Intervention 

To investigate the effect of listening while reading on the development of fluency skills 
specifically reading rate, accuracy, and reading comprehension, an independent samples 
t-test was conducted to compare the reading rate for both groups for both the baseline 
and the post-test. Despite that comparisons of means on pre-and post-test showed that 
the experimental group (chart 1) and control group (chart 2) performed better over time, 
there was no significant difference between both groups (table 2). Pre-test scores on the 
reading fluency rate showed no significant difference for both the control group and the 
experimental [t (59) = -1.211, p> .05, two-tailed].  The same is true for the post-test [t 
(59) = -1.164, p> .05, two-tailed]. Additionally, there was no significant difference in 
means for both groups in pre-test [t (59) = -1.470, p> .05, two-tailed] and post-test [t 
(59) = -1.146, p> .05, two-tailed] for the reading accuracy. This suggests that students 
reading rate improved over time but maybe not due to the implementation of the LWR 
intervention. 

As for the results of reading comprehension, subjects in the control group scored 
significantly better in reading comprehension on the pre-test than the students in the 
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experimental group (p=.024, two tailed).  However, at the end of the study, both groups 
did not show a significant difference in reading comprehension on the post-test (p = 
.616, two tailed). This indicates that the intervention may not have had the desired 
results.  However, it must be emphasized that this is an exploratory study and definitive 
conclusion cannot be made.  All of the quantitative results are indicated in Table 2 
below. 

 
Figure 1 
Experimental Group 

  
Figure 2 
Control Group 
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Table 2 
Pre-and Post-test Results on Accuracy, Reading Rate, and Comprehension  

Pre-test 

Variable Group N M SD df T p 

 
Accuracy 

Experimental 28 86.8571 6.53035 59 -1.470 0.147 

Control  33 83.7879 9.25931    

 
Reading rate 

Experimental 28 80.0357 20.94169 59 -1.211 0.322 

Control 33 73.4545 21.32793    

 
Comprehension 

Experimental 28 53.5714 22.47868 59 -0.504 0.024 

Control 33 41.2121 19.32576    

Post-test     

Variable Group N M SD df T p 

 

Accuracy 
Experimental 28 91.4286 4.63024 59 -1.146 0.256 

Control  33 90.0606 4.65658    

 

Reading rate 
Experimental 28 83.4032 18.88128 59 -1.164 0.782 

Control 33 77.5379 20.22053    

 

Comprehension 
Experimental 28 50.7143 18.44483 59 -2.310 0.616 

Control 33 47.8788 24.46395    

DISCUSSION 

Teachers and students’ perceptions of LWR were explored through focus groups and 
interviews. In alignment with Reissner (1997) teachers felt that the LWR experience 
improved students’ motivation to read. Data gathered during the focus group discussions 
emphasized how students perceived an improved level of vocabulary, spelling and 
pronunciation improved. Similar to Al- Nafisah (2011), students in this study expressed 
that they have weak reading habits in the sense that they do not read for pleasure 
because: 

● The unavailability of reading materials 

● Beliefs of having better things to do than reading 

● Difficulty of reading materials provided by the English department 

● Beliefs that improving reading is not as important as improving other language skills 

● Lack of family reading habits 
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It was also evident from the analysis of the focus group interviews that the participants 
had limited exposure to print. As children, the participants interviewed reported not 
being read to. Having weak reading habits and limited exposure to print were identified 
as indicators of poor reading comprehension (Stanovich, 2009). Indeed, it is reported in 
literature that exposure to print helps augment the lexical semantic knowledge and 
gaining a large vocabulary correlates positively with reading acquisition. Thus, being 
frequently exposed to print, is especially advantageous in widening the semantic 
lexicon, which in turn facilitates and enhances reading acquisition. Stanovich (2009) 
describes this relationship as one where ‘the rich get richer’ or as the ‘Mathew effect’ to 
which it is highly needed for students to know 98-99 % of the words before adequate 
comprehension was possible (Hirsh & Nation, 1992). 

To determine student’s reading levels, students’ reading rate, accuracy and 
comprehension levels were studied using a readily available reading program.  The 
results of the post-test showed that both groups improved over time for the reading rate 
and accuracy tasks. However, there was no significant difference between scores of 
experimental and control group students. This may mean that the improvement among 
readers is due mainly to the extensive reading of books that have reduced vocabulary 
range and simplified grammatical structures (Blevins, 2005; Elley & Mangubhai, 1983, 
Nakanishi, 2015; Nation & Cruz, 2009; Samuels, 2012; Robb & Susser, 1989).   
Reading comprehension improved in group 2 only. 

These results were in line with the idea that comprehension is a complex construct that 
requires the synergy of multiple factors. Comprehension can fail when students have 
problems with one or more of the following: (a) decoding words, (b) reading text with 
appropriate speed and accuracy (fluency); (c) understanding the meanings of words; (d) 
relating content to prior knowledge; (e) applying comprehension strategies; and (f) 
monitoring understanding (Blonder et al., 2018; Carlisle & Rice, 2002; National 
Institute for Literacy, 2001; RAND Reading Study Group, 2002). Therefore, studies that 
investigate the synthesis of reading with any of these skills may be useful. This is 
especially true to develop an accurate picture of reading with this population. 

LIMITATIONS 

This study used a reading program developed for the K12 environment.  It would be 
perhaps more beneficial to use a similar program for adults that is valid and reliable for 
this population specifically.  From this study, students appeared to appreciate the 
ubiquitous nature of the reading program.  While it was obvious that much of the 
material available was universal in content and may appeal to adult learners, a program 
for the specific population may be more motivational. Additionally, students could have 
experienced fatigue by the time of the post-test which could have impacted their scores. 
Another limitation is related to the type of instrument chosen for this study. While the 
informal reading assessment was validated before with adults (Worthy & Viise, 1996) 
and with students whose English is a foreign language (Avalos et al., 2007), was not 
used previously within this context, it. Another limitation with this study is the teacher 
factor.  Students in one group may have performed differently from another group due to 
the influence of the teacher.  Another limitation is the frequency of the running record 
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assessments.  Fountas, Pinnell, and Le Verrrier (2001) argue that running records should 
be used frequently to best inform practice.  The nature of the environment limited the 
frequency of the running records administered during the research. 

CONCLUSION AND RECOMMENDATIONS 

Despite that this study has several limitations, it represents the first exploratory study 
involving LWR as an assisted reading technique on reading rate, accuracy and 
comprehension among undergraduate SLL students in the United Arab Emirates (UAE). 
Using a case study design, results indicated that students reading rate and accuracy 
improved over time for all classes and marginally more so for the experimental group. 
Additionally, there was no significant change in the comprehension scores at the end of 
the study. In contradiction to Rasinski and Hoffman (2003) and VanWagenen et al. 
(1994) findings, LWR intervention in this context had little effect on reading fluency 
and comprehension. This could be explained due to the weak reading habits and lack of 
motivation and interest that were reported by the participants in the interviews. While 
these results may not be generalizable on a large scale and perhaps given more time, the 
results would be different for this population.  However, in the end, the study showed a 
process of a way to perhaps think about increasing reading skills in an adult population 
that struggles with reading in a second language. 

This study recommends future research using a larger sample size and for a longer 
period. In addition, similar studies could be carried out to draw reliable conclusions.  
Other studies, outside of fluency per se, could focus on question type and compare the 
performance in reading comprehension as a function of the language used to ask the 
comprehension questions. Still other studies could test vocabulary acquisition as well as 
spelling improvement due to listening while reading.  Future research could also 
investigate the effectiveness of LWR by comparing two groups with the same text but 
one in English and the other in Arabic or by comparing it with another type of evidence-
based reading intervention. Such experimental comparison could support teachers with 
evidence-based data related to the effectiveness of interventions that are designed to 
improve fluency and comprehension specifically within an SLL sample. 
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 Appendix 1:  Semi – Structured Interview Questions 

Questions for Students 

1- Approximately how many books have you read before coming to class?  

2- Can you share you experience and habits with reading as a child?  

3- How often did you read using technology such as computers and mobile devices? 

4- In what capacity did this reading take place?  

5- In which ways has reading a book in class changed your perception of reading, if 
at all?  

6- How has listening to the book while reading it on your iPad changed your habits 
of reading, if at all?  

7- Are you more likely to read on your iPad, why or why not?  

8- What benefits are there to listening to a book while reading?  

9- What advantages and disadvantages are there to reading on the iPad?  

10- What disadvantages are there to listening to a book while reading? 

Questions for Teachers 

1- In general, can you elaborate on how the reading program has been going in your 
class?  

2- Can you explain any positives that you have noticed?  

3- Can you explain any negatives that you have noticed?  

4- What would you change about the reading program?  

5- Have you noticed any changes in the way students read or approach reading due 
to this program? 

 

 


