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 One of the most significant issues in the process of teaching and learning is to 
consider students’ individual differences. The aim of this study was to investigate 
the interrelationships among Iranian EFL Learners’ Typical Intellectual 
Engagement, Learning Style and Preference for Assessment Methods. The sample 
included 200 English learners majoring in TEFL (Teaching English as a Foreign 
Language) from 3 different universities in Mashhad, Iran. To this end, three 
questionnaires; Typical Intellectual Engagement questionnaire, learning style 
inventory, and preference for assessment methods questionnaire were 
administered. The interrelationships among all variables were examined using path 
analysis. The model was fitted after some modifications. Findings revealed that 
Typical Intellectual Engagement was a positive and significant predictor of all four 
sub-factors of EFL learners’ learning styles except Activist. Also, all four sub-
factors of EFL learners’ learning styles except pragmatist were significant 
predictors of preference for assessment methods. Finally, the fit model showed that 
Typical Intellectual Engagement was a positive significant predictor of preferred 
assessment methods (r=.24, .22, p<.05). This study has several implications for 
teachers, learners, and syllabus designers. 

Keywords: individual differences, typical intellectual engagement, learning style, 
preference for assessment methods, path analysis 

INTRODUCTION 

Student's individual learning styles and preferences, their past experiences in learning 
language, their linguistic attitudes, their personalities, perhaps even their view on life, 
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are totally different and unique to them and these are the bases of individual differences 
(Mccarthy, 2010). Typical Intellectual Engagement (TIE) describes a person's 
engagement in intellectual activity and his or her interest in and need for a profound 
understanding of complex issues. Individuals with high engagement receive better 
grades, score significantly higher on standardized ability tests (Chamorro-Premuzic, 
Furnham, & Ackerman, 2006). Javadi, Mohammadi, and Akbari (2017) argued that the 
differences in students’ thinking process and intelligence influence their learning 
process. Besides, Pedone (2014) stated that cognitive strategies can help students to 
identify their learning styles and strategies.Therefore, on the whole, Typical Intellectual 
Engagement (TIE) seems to be related to students’ learning styles. 

According to Honey and Mumford (1986), there are four learning styles: activist, 
theorist, reflector and pragmatist. As they believed, activists are those individuals who 
take more risks and seek new experiences or learning situation. On the other hand, 
theorists are more likely to learn through rational thinking and logically analyzing ideas. 
Those with a reflector learning style prefer to observe and experimenting using a wide 
range of sources. Finally, pragmatists prefer to learn through doing and applying 
practical techniques and problem-solving tasks. 

According to Warn (2009), there is a significant relationship between students’ learning 
styles for different subjects and their orientations for different kinds of assessment 
methods. In fact, different people learn in different ways. Some learners are used to 
processing experiences and knowledge sequentially, others are used to doing it 
randomly; some learners are highly analytical in decision making, while others use their 
feelings for deciding; some learners are visual-oriented; others are verbal-oriented; some 
learners prefer to learn in groups; others prefer to learn alone and in home, etc (Ismail, 
Hussain, & Jamaluddin, 2010). Accordingly, students’ learning style can play a role in 
their preference for assessment methods (Pantiwati, Y., & Husamah, 2017). 

Based on Chamorro-Premuzic, Furnham, and Ackerman (2006), Typical Intellectual 
Engagement (TIE) is correlated with students’ academic performance and their marks in 
different tests. Also, Schroeders, Schipolowski and Böhme (2015) issued that TIE has 
been proved to be correlated with students' scholastic and academic performance. This 
will provide a rational to show that Typical Intellectual Engagement (TIE) and 
preference for assessment are correlated with each other. 

To provide a rationale for this proposed model, the researcher provide the following 
justifications gained through literature. On the whole, as mentioned by Pedone (2014); 
and Javadi, Mohammadi, and Akbari (2017), Typical Intellectual Engagement (TIE) 
seems to be related to students’ learning styles. Based on Rosenberg (2011), an 
individual’s cognitive styles can significantly predict his/her rational decision making 
style. So, a path can be directed from Typical Intellectual Engagement to Theorist. 
According to Rozencwajg and Corroyer (2005), reflective individuals who do any kind 
of analytic processes are cognitively mature and better compared with others. Therefore, 
it can be concluded that learners with a good level of Typical Intellectual Engagement 
are good Reflectors as well. Stadler, Becker, Gödker, Leutner, and Greiff (2015) hold 
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that intelligence strongly predicts one’s complex problem solving. So, it can be inferred 
that learners with a total typical Intellectual Engagement tend to be more Pragmatists. 

Ismail, Hussain, and Jamaluddin (2010) issued that there are different kinds of learning 
styles and students tend to learn different things in different ways. As stated by Warn 
(2009), students' learning styles have effects on their assessment. Accordingly, students’ 
learning style can play a role in their preference for assessment methods. Bazargani and 
Larsari (2013) found in their study that a person’s reflective thinking can impact his/her 
performance on multiple choice tests. Hence, a path can be directed from reflector to 
recognition-based exam. Eventually, Wang and Lin (2015) pinpointed that there is a 
positive and strong association between risk-taking and students’ desire in oral 
production items. Thereupon, a path can be directed from activist to production type of 
exams. . According to Wickramasinghe and Hettiarachchi (2017), the main problem lies 
in the fact that teachers do not develop their assessment methods based on their 
students’ preferred assessment methods as well as their learning styles while giving 
exams. Assessing all of the students based on only one or two methods of assessment is 
a problem which can be seen widely.  To tackle this problem, this study tries to show 
that students should be assessed via methods which are preferred by them and are in 
correspondence with their learning styles. 

As aforementioned by some researchers (Chamorro-Premuzic, Furnham, & Ackerman, 
2006; Schroeders, Schipolowski & Böhme, 2015), Typical Intellectual Engagement 
(TIE) is correlated with students’ academic assessment and their marks in different tests. 
This provides a rational to show that Typical Intellectual Engagement (TIE) and 
preference for assessment are correlated with each other. So, there are significant 
relationships between Typical Intellectual Engagement and two total types of preferred 
exams. The following research question is probed in this study: Does the proposed 
model of associations among typical intellectual engagement, learning style, and 
preference for assessment show enough adequacy for the context of Iran? 

METHOD 

Participants and Setting 

According to Kline (2015), at least 200 participants are needed to run a path analysis. 
Therefore, the sample of this study comprised 200 English learners from different 
universities in Mashhad, Iran, namely Islamic Azad University, Tabaran Institute of 
Higher Education and Toos University of Mashhad. The method through which the 
sample was selected was convenience sampling for the availability and manageability 
reasons. The sample included both males and females with different age groups ranging 
from young to middle aged students. Their field of study was Teaching English as a 
Foreign Language consisting, doing both Bachelor’s and Master’s degrees. 

Instrumentation 

 In this study, three kinds of questionnaires were administered. Typical Intellectual 
Engagement was assessed through using a revised validated version of Wilhelm et al.’s 
(2003) German short scale which is a three dimensional model including reading, 
contemplation and intellectual curiosity. The students participating in this study 
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indicated their agreement/disagreement with 18 statements on a 4-point Likert scale 
ranging from strongly agree to strongly disagree. The reliability of this questionnaire is 
0.77 (Table 3).  

The second instrument was Honey and Mumford’s Learning Style Questionnaire (1986) 
to identify preferred learning style of the students which are activist, theorist, reflector 
or pragmatist. The questionnaire included 80 statements with a box in front of each 
statement. 20 items were allocated to each learning style. The participants were asked to 
place a tick in the boxes in front of the sentences if they mostly agree with that sentence. 
Accordingly, if they did not, they had to leave the box blank. At last, the sum of the 
items showed their dominant learning style. The reliability of this questionnaire is 0.82 
(Table 3).  

The learners’ preference for different kinds of assessment methods were gathered 
through a self-developed questionnaire which was validated in this study through 
running confirmatory factor analysis, the results are displayed in Table 6. This 
questionnaire consisted of 7 statements which asked for learners’ testing methods 
preference including: essay-type test, completion test, multiple choice test, cloze test, 
true-false test, information-gap test, and oral exam. Based on Shintani, Natsuko, 
Shaofeng, and Ellis (2013) essay-type, completion test, cloze test, information gap and 
oral exams were put into the category of production tests which the learners are asked to 
produce sentences effectively and reactively. On the other hand, multiple-choice or true-
or-false tests were put to the category of recognition-based tests (Fazio, Agarwal, 
Marsh, & Roediger, 2010). The reliability of this questionnaire was calculated to be 
0.73 (Table 3).  

Procedure 

Collecting data started in early February, 2018 and it took almost one month. 
Participants answered 3 questionnaires with the total time of 25 minutes as well as 
giving their demographic information; i.e., name (optional), field of study, gender and 
age. Then, the collected data were fed into the SPSS software to calculated the 
normality assumptions and descriptive statistics. Then through AMOS software, a path 
analysis was run to verify the interrelationships among the three variables.  

Study Design and Analysis 

The method of this study was quantitative in nature which investigated the 
interrelationships among the variables within a correlational design. The 
interrelationships among all variables were determined by using Structural Equation 
Modeling (SEM), specifically path analysis. 

FINDINGS  

To check the normality of data distribution, the Kolmogorov-Smirnov test was 
employed. This test is used to check whether the distribution deviates from a 
comparable normal distribution. If the p-value is non-significant (p>.05), we can say that 
the distribution of a sample is not significantly different from a normal distribution, 
therefore it is normal. If the p-value is significant (p<.05) it implies that the distribution 
is not normal. Table 1 presents the results of the Kolmogorov-Smirnov test.  
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Table 1 
The Results of K-S Test 
 Df Sig. 

Learning Style 189 .075 

Typical intellectual engagement 189 .083 

Preference 189 .060 

As it can be seen, the obtained sig value for all variables is higher than .05. Therefore, it 
can safely be concluded that the data is normally distributed across all the variables. 

Table 2 presents descriptive statistics of all constructs of the study including the mean, 
standard deviation, maximum and minimum scores.  

Table 2 
Descriptive Statistics of all constructs  

 N Minimum Maximum Mean Std. Deviation 

 

 

Learning Style 

Activist 189 2.00 19.00 9.74 3.21 

Reflector 189 2.00 20.00 12.73 3.67 

Theorist 189 3.00 19.00 11.73 3.66 

Pragmatist 189 2.00 20.00 11.43 3.39 

Learning Style 189 18.00 72.00 45.64 9.50 

 

TIE 

typical intellectual 

engagement 

189 28.00 66.00 48.07 6.77 

 

Preference for 

Assessment  

Recognition-based 189 3.00 10.00 8.23 1.58 

Production-based 189 8.00 25.00 16.21 3.78 

Preference 189 14.00 34.00 24.44 4.20 

The possible range of scores for all four sub-constructs of learning styles with 20 items 
is between 0-20 and for total learning style is between 0-80. As the results show, among 
four sub-constructs of learning styles, Reflector has the highest mean score (12.73), and 
activist has the lowest mean score (9.74). The possible range of score for Recognition-
based with 2 items is between 2 and 10, for Production-based with 5 items is between 5 
and 25, and for total preference with 7 items is between 7 and 35.  

Also the reliability of the instruments utilized in the study is summarized in Table 3 
which is obtained from Cronbach alpha analyses.   

Table 3 
Results of Cronbach Alpha Indexes After Reliability Analysis 

Scale Number of items Cronbach alpha 

Learning Style 80 .82 

Typical intellectual engagement 18 .77 

Preference 7 .73 

As can be seen, the utilized questionnaires gained acceptable indexes of Cronbach alpha 
as a whole: Learning Style Scale (.82), Typical intellectual engagement Scale (.77), and 
Preference (.73). 

This study is an attempt to find any probable interrelationships among TIE, learning 
style, and preference for assessment through proposing a model of associations among 
them. Figure 1 displays the probable paths, gained throughout the literature, for different 
constructs of this study. 
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Figure 1  
The proposed model for interrelationships among Typical Intellectual Engagement, 
learning style and preference for assessment methods 

Figure 2 shows the path analysis of the relationship between Typical Intellectual 
Engagement, learning style and preference for assessment methods. As it shows, an 
estimate is displayed on each path. 

 
Figure 2  
The path analysis of the relationship between variables before modification 

As indicated in Figure 2, an estimate is displayed on each path. This standardized 
estimate is the standardized coefficient or beta coefficients (β) resulting from an analysis 
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carried out on independent variables that have been standardized. It explains the 
predictive power of the independent variable and the effect size. The closer the 
magnitude to 1.0, the higher the correlation and the greater the predictive power of the 
variable is. Table 4 shows the goodness of fit indices before modification.  

Table 4 
Goodness of Fit Indices Before Modification 

 X2/df GFI NFI CFI RMSEA 

Acceptable fit <3 >.90 >.90 >.90 <.08 
Model 6.25 .87 .88 .86 .098 

As demonstrated by Table 4, (the chi-square/df ratio (6.25), RMSEA (.098), GFI (.87), 
NFI (.88) and CFI (.86)), all the fit indices do not lie within the acceptable fit 
thresholds. Therefore, the model needs some modifications. In order to modify the 
model, five non-significant paths were removed: 1) Activist to recognition-based (β= 
.00, p>.01), 2) Pragmatist to recognition-based (β= .00, p>.01), 3) Theorist to 
production -based (β= .06, p>.01), 4) Pragmatist to production -based (β= .10, p>.01), 
and 5) Typical Intellectual Engagement to activist (β= .02, p>.01). After applying the 
modifications, the model was run again, the results of which are displayed in Table 5. 

Table 5 
Goodness of Fit Indices After Modification 

 X2/df GFI NFI CFI RMSEA 

Acceptable fit <3 >.90 >.90 >.90 <.08 
Model 2.79 .93 .91 .92 .079 

As demonstrated by Table 5, the chi-square/df ratio (2.79), RMSEA (.079), GFI (.93), 
NFI (.91) and CFI (.92), all the fit indices lie within the acceptable fit thresholds. Hence, 
it can be concluded that the proposed model had perfect fit with the empirical data after 
modification. Figure 3 shows the model after modifications. 

 
Figure 3  
The model after modification 
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In order to examine the validity of the preference for assessment questionnaire, 
Confirmatory Factor Analysis (CFA) was used. In this study, x2/df, GFI, CFI and 
RMSE were used. As Table 6 shows, all the goodness of fit indices are within the 
acceptable range. Therefore, the scale enjoyed perfect validity. 

Table 6 
Goodness of Fit Indices (for Validating Preference for Assessment Questionnaire) 

 X2/df GFI CFI RMSEA 

Acceptable fit <3 >.90 >.90 <.08 

Model 2.59 .91 .92 .08 

Goodness of fit indices can be seen in Table 6. In this study, χ
2
/df, GFI, CFI and 

RMSEA were used. As Table 6 shows, all the goodness of fit indices are within the 
acceptable range. Therefore, preference for assessment questionnaire enjoyed perfect 
validity. 

DISCUSSION 

According to path analysis which was run in this study, Typical Intellectual Engagement 
was positively a predictor of all four sub-factors of learning styles except Activist. 
Findings indicated a significant relationship between Typical Intellectual Engagement 
and Theorist (r=.306, p<.05). In fact, Theorist has the highest correlation with Typical 
Intellectual Engagement. The obtained results were according to those of Rosenberg 
(2011) who found that one’s cognitive aspects and style were significantly predicting 
his/her rational decision making style. So, it seems that individuals with a good level of 
Typical Intellectual Engagement are more likely to make logical and rational decisions. 
Results showed that the relationship between Typical Intellectual Engagement and 
Reflector were significant (r=.24, p<.05). The findings were consistent with what 
Rozencwajg and Corroyer (2005) obtained in their study. Therefore, it can be concluded 
that learners with a good level of Typical Intellectual Engagement are better thinkers 
and analyzer and enjoy pondering about aspects of a matter. Results indicated the 
relationship between Pragmatist and Typical Intellectual Engagement which was 
moderately significant (r=.30, p<.05). Such a positive relationship gained in this study 
was in agreement with Stadler et al. (2015) who came to the conclusion that intelligence 
is a strong predictor of complex problem solving. So, it can be inferred that learners 
with a total typical Intellectual Engagement tend to be more Pragmatists and interested 
in problem solving tasks.  

The findings demonstrated that the relationship between learners’ Recognition-based 
preference for assessment and Theorist was positively significant (r=.28 p<.05). The 
results were in contrast with what Stanger-Hall (2012) found in her study. She came to 
the conclusion that there is no significant relationship between higher-level thinking 
such as logical reasoning and critical thinking and traditional multiple choice exams. 
From the researcher’s point of view, the reason behind these differences in results might 
be the fact that students might not have an adequate knowledge of language to produce 
the answers in English. Another possibility is that since some of them might prefer to 
cheat during their exams, they were more likely to show more interest for recognition 
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tests which are easier to cheat. So, they chose recognition-based exams as their 
dominant preferred assessments. Also, the results showed that there is a positive 
significant relationship between learners’ Recognition-based preference for assessment 
and Reflector (r=.309 p<.05). The results were in line with those of Bazargani and 
Larsari (2013) and what they found in their study. They claimed that one’s reflective 
thinking or observation can influence his/her performance and preference on multiple 
choice items test. Therefore, it can be inferred that the learners with the dominant styles 
of Reflectors prefer the recognition-based exams. The relationship between learners’ 
Production-based preference for assessment and Activist was significant (r=.17 p<.05). 
Findings were in agreement with what Wang and Lin (2015) found in their study. As 
they claimed, there is a positive and strong correlation between risk-taking and students’ 
desire in oral production items. Therefore, it can be concluded that learners with the 
dominant styles of Activists who tend to take risks are more likely to prefer production-
based exams. Furthermore, a significant relationship between learners’ Production-based 
preference for assessment and Reflector (r=.16 p>.05) was gained. Findings were in 
contrast with those of Rastegar and Honarmand (2016). They issued that there is no 
significant relationship between cloze test and reflective thinking and observation. In 
fact, based on the findings of this study, individuals with the dominant styles of 
Reflectors are interested in both recognition and production types of exams. The 
probable reason behind this inconsistency with the previous literature might be due to 
the difference in the degree of tests difficulties or some distracted factors in the test 
environment which might hinder the reflection. Results indicated that there is no 
significant relationship between learners’ Production-based preference for assessment 
and Pragmatist (r=.09 p>.05). Obtained results were in contrast with what Ghodrati, 
Bavandian, Moghaddam, and Attaran (2014) gained in their study. They believed that 
there is a high correlation between cloze type of test and elements of problem solving. In 
fact, based on the results of our study, learners with the dominant styles of Pragmatists 
show no interest for any kind of exams. This might be because the participants’ 
proficiency level of proficiency was not controlled which might affect their performance 
on cloze tests. 

In the present study, the relationship between EFL learners’ Typical Intellectual 
Engagement and their Recognition-based preference for assessment were significant 
(r=.24 p<.05). Also, Findings showed a significant relationship between learners’ 
Typical Intellectual Engagement and their Production-based preference for assessment 
(r=.22 p>.05). The obtained results among Typical Intellectual Engagement and two 
constructs of preference for assessment methods were in line with what Zahedi and 
Moghaddam (2016) found. According to them, different kinds of intelligences are 
correlated positively with performance on multiple-choice and cloze tests. 

This study has several implications for teachers, syllabus designers, and material 
developers. By considering their students’ learning style and preferred assessment type, 
they can improve the instructional and educational system (Donough & Shaw, 2003). 
Along the same line, Tomlinson (2011) states that materials should consider different 
learning styles, which means that activities should be variable and should fit to all 
learning styles. So, the present study can be helpful to the material developers as well. 
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Furthermore, Stranks (2003) shed light on the importance of considering students’ 
learning styles for syllabus designers. He believed that tasks which contain mental 
activities will not suit all learners. This implies that syllabus designers should take into 
account the students' learning styles for grading and sequencing tasks. 

CONCLUSION 

This study has attempted to shed light on the interrelationships among Iranian EFL 
learners’ Typical Intellectual Engagement, learning style and preference for assessment 
methods. Based on path analysis, Typical Intellectual Engagement was a positive and 
significant predictor of all four sub-factors of EFL learners’ learning styles except 
Activist. Besides, all four sub-factors of EFL learners’ learning styles except pragmatist 
were proven to be significant predictors of preference for assessment methods. At last, 
the fit model showed that Typical Intellectual Engagement was a positive significant 
predictor of both constructs of preference for assessment methods, namely recognition 
and production based tests.  

Further research is needed to illuminate the possible interrelationship among the 
variables of this study and other variables which are related to learners’ specific 
cognitive and affective factors. 
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